
MUNICIPALITY OF PENN HILLS

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEMOLITIONS - Lincoln Park 2010
DATE: Feb. 9, 2010

CONTRACTOR

D. J. DEMOLITION JADELL MINNIE- JJM CONTRACT- KEN REILLY LUTTERMAN
FIELD CONST. ING INC. CONTRACTING EXCAVATING
SVCS., INC.

ITEM TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

1 EACH 1236 BLACKADORE 7,000.00                  7,000.00              NO BID 8,000.00            6,900.00              

2 EACH 1238 BLACKADORE 6,000.00                  6,500.00              NO BID 8,000.00            6,900.00              

3 EACH 214 COLUMBIA 4,250.00                  5,000.00              8,500.00              5,000.00            3,200.00              

4 EACH 217 COLUMBIA 4,250.00                  5,000.00              8,500.00              5,000.00            4,200.00              

5 EACH 238 COLUMBIA 4,250.00                  6,000.00              8,500.00              5,900.00            3,950.00              

6 EACH 113 CENTRAL STREET 6,170.00                  7,000.00              8,500.00              5,000.00            3,100.00              

7 EACH 1834 FUNSTON STREET 7,000.00                  6,000.00              9,500.00              7,000.00            6,450.00              

8 EACH 1903 FUNSTON STREET 7,000.00                  5,200.00              8,500.00              6,000.00            4,840.00              

9 EACH 1846 LINCOLN 3,445.00                  6,000.00              11,500.00            10,000.00          3,990.00              

10 EACH 1939 LINCOLN 7,000.00                  8,000.00              9,500.00              6,000.00            6,190.00              

11 EACH 8017 MT. CARMEL ROAD 2,900.00                  5,700.00              6,000.00              5,000.00            2,900.00              

TOTAL PROPOSAL 59,265.00                67,400.00            70,900.00          52,620.00            

BOND/CHECK BOND BOND BOND BOND BOND

Bid Committee: Maureen Sorce, Admin. Secretary; Diane G. Fitzhenry, Deputy Clerk;
Howard Davidson, Director Planning



MUNICIPALITY OF PENN HILLS

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED: DEMOLITIONS - Lincoln Park 2010
DATE: Feb. 9, 2010

CONTRACTOR

MASSARELLI THOMAS DIDIANO TONY PERRI
EXCAVATING LLC & SON, INC. CONTRACTING

ITEM TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

1 EACH 1236 BLACKADORE 9,248.00                  NO BID 8,190.00              

2 EACH 1238 BLACKADORE 8,946.00                  NO BID 8,205.00              

3 EACH 214 COLUMBIA 5,368.00                  NO BID 9,382.00              

4 EACH 217 COLUMBIA 4,668.00                  NO BID 8,901.00              

5 EACH 238 COLUMBIA 5,586.00                  NO BID 8,200.00              

6 EACH 113 CENTRAL STREET 5,584.00                  NO BID 6,855.00              

7 EACH 1834 FUNSTON STREET 5,538.00                  NO BID 6,893.00              

8 EACH 1903 FUNSTON STREET 5,623.00                  NO BID 6,899.00              

9 EACH 1846 LINCOLN 7,274.00                  NO BID 7,893.00              

10 EACH 1939 LINCOLN 6,769.00                  9,800.00               11,985.00            

11 EACH 8017 MT. CARMEL ROAD 3,148.00                  7,500.00               5,198.00              

TOTAL PROPOSAL 67,752.00                88,601.00            

BOND/CHECK BOND BOND BOND
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